Davenport Community Schools

Operations Center

1008 W. Kimberly Road
Davenport, IA 52806

Tabulation Sheet

Buchanan, Eisenhower, & Jackson Interior Door Frame Replacement
March 15,2007 2:30 P.M.

Buchanan Frame Eisenhower Frame |Jackson Frame
Company Bid Bond |Replacement Cost |Replacement Cost |Replacement Cost Optional Bid Unit Pricing
American Industrial Door YES $41,124.48 $41,230.72 $39,942.26 $122,297.46 $1,288.46
Big Dog Construction NO BID
East Moline Glass NO BID
Hillebrand Construction YES $39,420.00 $39,420.00 $38,190.00 $117,025.00 $870.50
Interior Construction. Inc. NO BID
Mid-American Glazing Co. NO BID
Precision Builders, Inc. NO BID
Quad City Acustical Ceilings NO BID
Rock Island Glass Co. YES $78,400.00 $78,400.00 $75,950.00 $232,750.00 $2,450.00
Story Construction YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $273,569.00 $2,879.00
Swanson Construction YES $44,175.00 $44,175.00 $42,940.00 $128,242.00 $944.00




